
Good prospects for gold, silver and platinum 
 

 
 

Wherever the journey goes, the U.S. dollar should continue to weaken, and that is 
good for precious metals. 
 
Basically, two different scenarios are possible in the near future. One is that the global 
economy drifts into recession. It is still debatable whether it is not already there. If the 
economy is facing a severe recession, with GDP shrinking, then corporate profits would 
fall. Government bonds would initially hold up well. Investors would then turn away 
from financial assets and turn more to precious metals. However, really serious events 
would have to occur as triggers. 
 
The other possible scenario assumes a recovering economy, with no recession in sight 
in the foreseeable future. Presumably, inflation would then remain at a high level, the 
price of oil would increase, and interest rates would continue to rise. This would be a 
disaster for the many countries with immense national debts. High interest payments 
would again lead to the use of the money printing presses. To counteract such 
misfortune, a precious metal investment has always been a tried and tested means 
and still is today. Because gold does not lose its value and preserves savings. By the 
way, February is one of the best gold months from a statistical point of view. 
 
It is in third place on the best list. January again proved its status as the best gold 
month this year. At the end of January, the gold price was $1,923.90 per ounce, or 
1,772.87 euros. Last year, the gold price rose six percent in February, a very good 
result. The cause was the Russian invasion. In February 2020, gold was also in high 
demand with the onset of the pandemic. Investors can also bet on gold with the stocks 
of OceanaGold or Revival Gold.  
 
OceanaGold is already producing, with projects located in the U.S. (Haile Gold Mine), 
the Philippines (Didipio Mine) and New Zealand (Macraes and Waihi).  



 
Revival Gold - https://www.commodity-tv.com/play/revival-gold-pre-feasibility-study-
coming-early-2023/ - is looking after the revival of the Beartrack-Arnett gold project in 
Idaho. The project scores with good drill results and the mineralization is still open in 
all directions. 
 
Current corporate information and press releases from OceanaGold (- 
https://www.resource-capital.ch/en/companies/oceanagold-corp/ ). 
 
 
 
 
In accordance with §34 WpHG I would like to point out that partners, authors and 
employees may hold shares in the respective companies addressed and thus a 
possible conflict of interest exists. No guarantee for the translation into English. Only 
the German version of this news is valid. 
 
Disclaimer: The information provided does not represent any form of recommendation 
or advice. Express reference is made to the risks in securities trading. No liability can 
be accepted for any damage arising from the use of this blog. I would like to point out 
that shares and especially warrant investments are always associated with risk. The 
total loss of the invested capital cannot be excluded. All information and sources are 
carefully researched. However, no guarantee is given for the correctness of all 
contents. Despite the greatest care, I expressly reserve the right to make errors, 
especially with regard to figures and prices. The information contained herein is taken 
from sources believed to be reliable, but in no way claims to be accurate or complete. 
Due to court decisions, the contents of linked external sites are also co-responsible 
(e.g. Landgericht Hamburg, in the decision of 12.05.1998 - 312 O 85/98), as long as 
there is no explicit dissociation from them. Despite careful control of the content, I do 
not assume liability for the content of linked external pages. The respective operators 
are exclusively responsible for their content. The disclaimer of Swiss Resource Capital 
AG also applies: https://www.resource-capital.ch/en/disclaimer/ 
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